ORDINANCE NO. 194

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF UNIVERSITY PLACE, WASHINGTON,
AMENDING TITLE 14, BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODE, OF THE
UNIVERSITY PLACE MUNICIPAL CODE BY THE ADOPTION AND
AMENDMENT OF THE 1997 UNIFORM CODES IN KEEPING WITH THE
REQUIREMENTS OF RCW 19.27, THE STATE BUILDING CODE.

WHEREAS, the Legislature of the State of Washington directs cities to enforce the provisions of
the State Building Code, in accordance with RCW 19.27 and 70.92; and

WHEREAS, RCW 18.27. 040 authorizes cities to amend the State Building Code as it applies
within their jurisdiction; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that it is in the best interest of the public health, safety, and
general welfare {o establish uniform and current procedures and requirements for the construction and
maintenance of buildings; NOW, THEREFORE,

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF UNIVERSITY PLACE, WASHINGTON, POES ORDAIN .
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Amending Section 14.05.020, Purpose Section 14.05.020 of the Umversﬂy
Place Municipal Code (UPMC), Purpose, is amended to read as follows:

14.05.020
Purpose.

The purpose of the codes and regulations adopted in this title is to provide minimum_standards to
safeguard life, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction,
quality of materials. use and occupancy, location and maintenance of ali buildings and structures within
the City of University Place. it is not the purpose or intent to create or designate any particular class or
group of persons {0 be especially protected or_benefited, nor |s |t 1ntended to create anv spemal
relat:onshlp w;th any individual. ! 2 d

and-regulations:
(Ord. 37 § 2, 1995).

Section 2. Amending Section 14.05.030, Adoption of codes hy reference. Section
14.05.030 of the UPMC, Adoption of codes by reference, is amended to read as follows:

14.05.030
Adoption of codes by reference
The followmg codes, i d

amended as set forth in this chapter.

A. The Uniform Building Code {UBC) Volumes LIl & [ll and-the Uniform Building Code Standards, 1994
1997 Edition, published by the International Conference of Building Officials, as adopted and amended by

the Washington State Building Code Council and-ineluded in Chapter 51-40 WAC, and as may sub-

M:ord/building-codes update.doc



sequently be amended by this chapter, are hereby adopted along with Appendix Chapters 3, 4 (Division 1),
9, 44, 15, 16, 33, and 34,

B. The Uniform Mechanical Code (UMC) 4094 1997 Edition, i ini
Appendix B published by the International Conference of Building Officials, as adopted and amended bv
the Washmqton State Building Code Coungcil in Chapter 51-42 WAC.

C. The Uniform Fire Code (UFC) Volumes | & || a-nd—-th&Unﬁeﬂxr—FiFe—Geele—Stan&aFds 1094~ 1997
Edition, published by the Uniform Fire Code Institute, as adopted and amended by the Washington State
Building Code Council and included in Chapter §4-34 51-44 and 6436 51-45 WAC and as may be
subsequently amended by this chapter, are hereby adopted, along with the provisions of article 9 as
subsequently amended by this chapter and; Appendix Chapters I-A, [-B, I-C, I-A, II-C, HI-D, II- E, I-F, -G,
1=K, - 11-d, B-A, 1B, WI-C, 111D, V-B, V-A, VI-A, VI-B, VI-C, VI-D, VI-E, and VI-F; VI-G, VI-H, and VI-I;
provided, that not withstanding any wording in this code, participants in refigious ceremonies shall not be
precluded from carrying hand-held candles.

D. The Uniform Plumbing Code and the Uniform Plumbing Code Standards, 4884 1997 Edition, as
published by the International Association of Piumbing and Mechanical Officials, and as adopted by the
Washington State Building Code Council and included in Chapters 84-26-and-54+27 51-46 and 51-47
WAC and as may be subsequently amended by this chapter, are hereby adopted with the exception of
Chapters 11 and 12.

E. The rules and regulations adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council for making
huilding and facilities accessible to and usable by physically handicapped or elderly persons as provided

in Chapter 51-30 WAC-efHestive-Apri1894-

~F. The Washington State Energy Code as adopted and amended by the Washington State Building
Code Council and included in Chapter 51-11 WAC. efféctiveJune 30,1595,

G. The Washington State Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality Code as adopted and amended by the
Washington State Building Code Council and included in Chapter 51-13 WAC. efestive-June-30-4805.

H. Washington State Historic Building Code as adopted and amended by the Washington State
Building Code Council and included in Chapter 51-19 WAC, first edition.

I. Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 4884 1997 Edition, as published by the
international Conference of Building Officials, and as may be subsequently amended by this chapter.

J. The Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition, as_published by the International Conference of Building
Officials, and as may be subsequently amended by this chapter.

dJ. K. National Electrical Code as published by the National Fire Protection Association adopted by the
State of Washington and enforced by the Tacoma Public Ulilities, electrical division, with the current
edition in force at the time of the adoption of the ordinance codified in this chapter along with other
reguirements of the electric utility.

¥: L. Uniform Sign Code, 4884 1997 Edition, published by the International Conference of Building Offi-
cials.
(Ord. 45 § 1, 1995; Ord. 37 § 3, 1995).

Section 3 Amending Section 14.05.110, Building code amendments, Section 14.05.110
of the UPMC, Building code amendments, is amended {o read as follows:

M:ord/building-codes update.doc



14.05.110

Building code amendments.
The following sections in the adopted Uniform Building Code are hereby amended:

M:ard/building-codes update.doc



A.Section 106.2, item #5 is amended to read:;

Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet {1219 mm) in height measured from the bottom of the footing
to the top of the wall, provided the wall is set back from any adjacent property fines or structures a
distance at least equal to the height of the wall and the material retained slopes 1:2 (or less) up and
away from the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, Il or 1I-A liquids.

amended:
B. Section 307.1.6 is amended by addition of the following exception:

EXCEPTION: When an HMMP is required, the building official may accept the applicant repori(s)
used for compliance with requirements of 40 CFR “Hazardous Chemical Reporting and
Community Right-to-Know Regulations” under Title Ili of the Superfund Amendments and
Reauthorization Act of 1986 (SARA).

M:ord/building-codes update.doc



C. Sec:t;on a04. 2 1is amended by the addition of the followmg Q.aragraghs:

The provisions of this section shall apply to existing a# buildings te which are altered, repaired or
remodeled to more than fifty percent of its county assessment value at the time of the first permit
application, or will-bealtered-orrepaired within any seventy month period of time therafter. Any
additions to an existing structure shall be considered new construction and subject to the
requirements of this section.

Areca separation walls as specified by UBC section 504 6 shall not be conSIdered for reduction of
ﬂoor areas noted in this chapter

D. Section 904.2.2 item #5 is amended to read:

5. All bundlngs four or more storaes in height. For the purposes of thls sectlon -—a—ster—y—shau—be

E. Section 904.2.3.1 is amended to read:

904.2.3.1 Drinking Establishments. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in rcoms used
by the occupants for the consumption of alcoholic beverages, nightclubs, or dancing
establishments where the total gross floor area exceeds 5,000 square feet. Area separation walls
as noted in Section 504.6 of the Uniform Building Code shall not be considered to separate a
building to enable deletion of the required fire sprinkler system.

M:ord/building-codes update.doc



r. Sectlon 904 is amended bv the addition of a new seclion, sectlon 904.2.10

Section 804-2.8 904.2.10 Other Occupancy Requirements. In all accupancies requiring 2,000 gal-
lons per minute or more of fire flow per Appendix lll-A of the Uniform Fire Code, or where the total
floor area included within the surrounding exterior walls on all fioor levels including basements
exceeds 10,000 square feet. Area separation walls, as noted in Section 504.8 of the Uniform
Building Code, shall not be considered to separate a building to enable deletlon of the required fire
sprinkler system. EXCEPTION: Group U occupancies.

G. Section 1003.3.3 is am.ended to read as written ih the Uniform Building Code, 1997

Edition, as published by the International Conference of Building Officials, and not as
amended by chapter 51-40 WAC.

H. Appendix Chapter 33, Excavation and Grading is amended by replacement of all
references to Building Official with City Engineer.

(Ord. 45 § 3, 1995: Ord, 37 § 11, 1995).

Section 4 Amending Section 14.05.120, Fire code amendments. Section 14.05.120 of
the UPMC, Fire code amendments, is amended to read as follows:

14.65.120 -
Fire code amendments.
The following sections in the Uniform Fire Code are hereby amended:

A Permiis-and-Fees—URG-Section105.3-Amended. Section 105.3 of-the-UniformFire Code 18094
Editien, is hereby-amended to read:

Section 105.3(a) Permit Applications. All applications for a permit required by this Code shall be
made to the Fire District in such form and detail as it shall prescribe. Applications for permits shall
be accompanied by such plans as required by the Chief.

Section 105.3(b) Permit Fees. The Fire District shall collect fees for permits, plan review, and
inspection services as prescribed in the City of University Place “Fee Schedule.”

M:ord/building-codes update.doc



B.Definitions—UEG Section 201 Amended-Ariicle= of the-Uniform-Fire-Code,-1894-Edition, is hereby
amended by adding to the stated sections the following entitled *Definitions” to read as follows:

Section 207. Fixed Fire Protection System. All automatic or manual sprinkier systems, standpipe
systems, fire alarm systems, fire detection and/or warning systems, fire and/or explosion
suppressions systems, fire alarm signaling systems or other equipment or devices that are
intended to detect, control or extinguish a fire or explosion that are built-in or affixed to the
premises they protect.

C.Section 901.4.3 is amended to read:

901.4.3 Fire-protection equipment and fire hydrants. Fire-protection equipment and fire hydrants shall
be clearly identified in an approved manner to pervent obstruction by parking and other obstructions. A
minimum unobstrucied distance of 15 feet on both sides of a fire hydrant along the access roadway
shall be maintained. See section 901.7 for fire lane marking.

D. A new section 901.7 is added reading:

901.7 Fire Lane Marking. When, in the opinion of the chief, it is probable that the width of an access
road may be _ diminished or access to Fire-Protection equipment or fire hydrants may be obstructed, the
chlef may require the marking of fire lanes to include signs posted at appropriate locations,

Marking of access roads shall be painted with international red colored paint.

Fire Lanes shall be identified by a 8 inch wide Jine and block letters 4 inches high painted in the Jane, at
30 feet, or such other intervals which the Chief determines to be reasonable, stating “Emergency Vehicles
Only-No Parking”. Signs shall be posted on or immediately next to the curb line, or on the building. Signs
shali be 12" x 18" and shall have letters and background of contrasting colors, readily leaible from at least
a 50 foot distance. Signs shall be posted at a minimum no further than 50 feet apart, unless a greater
distance is deemed reasonable by the Chief, nor shall they be more than 4 feet from the ground unless a
greater height is determined necessary by the Chief.

E. A new paragraph is added to section 902.2.4.1 reading:

Construction and_maintenance of Emergency Vehicle Access (EV) shall be in accordance with
University Place Municipal Code section 13.15.560.

M:ord/building-codes update.doc



M:ord/building-codes update.doc



(Ord. 45 § 4, 1995; Ord. 37 § 12, 1995).

Section 5.  Severability If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this Title shall be
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constltutlonallty of any other section, sentence,

" clause or phrase of this Title.

Section 6. Publication and Effective Date. A summary of this ordinance consisting
of its title shall be published in the official newspaper of the city. This ordinance shall be effective
five days after such publication.

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL ON JUNE 1, 1998

ebbie Klosowski, Mayor

M:ord/building-codes update.doc



- ATTEST:

Susan Matthew, City Clerk

VED AS {0 FORM:

b D p—

Til;r‘lothy X! Slf//ﬁlan, City Attorney

Date of Publication: 6/3/98
Effective Date: 6/8/98

M:ord/building-codes update.doc





