
ORDINANCE NO. 194 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF UNIVERSITY PLACE, WASHINGTON, 
AMENDING TITLE 14, BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODE, OF THE 
UNIVERSITY PLACE MUNICIPAL CODE BY THE ADOPTION AND 
AMENDMENT OF THE 1997 UNIFORM CODES IN KEEPING WITH THE 
REQUIREMENTS OF RCW 19.27, THE STATE BUILDING CODE. 

WHEREAS, the Legislature of the State of Washington directs cities to enforce the provisions of 
the State Building Code, in accordance with RCW 19.27 and 70.92; and 

WHEREAS, RCW 19.27.040 authorizes cities to amend the State Building Code as it applies 
within their jurisdiction; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that it is in the best interest of the public health, safety, and 
general welfare to establish uniform and current procedures and requirements for the construction and 
maintenance of buildings; NOW, THEREFORE, 

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF UNIVERSITY PLACE, WASHINGTON, DOES ORDAIN . 
AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. Amending Section 14.05.020, Purpose Section 14.05.020 of the University 
Place Municipal Code (UPMC), Purpose, is amended to read as follows: 

14.05.020 
Purpose. 

The purpose of the codes and regulations adopted in this title is to provide minimum standards to 
safeguard life, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, 
quality of materials, use and occupancy. location and maintenance of all buildings and structures within 
the City of University Place. It is not the purpose or intent to create or designate any particular class or 
group of persons to be especially protected or benefited, nor is it intended to create any special 
relationship with any individual. Fe!J~la!e llHilElin9s anEI cens!F~ctien within the city anEI te f)F9tect the flHlllic 
health, safety anEI wellarn el !he 9eneFal flHl:Jlis, anEI net te sFeale eF etheFWise estalllish eF desi9nale any 
f)artis~laF class eF !JF9Hfl el fJeFsens whe will eF she~IEI Ile esf)esially f)rntected lly the teFFRS el these sedes 
and Fe!JHlatiens. 
(Ord. 37 § 2, 1995). 

Section 2. Amending Section 14.05.030, Adoption of codes by reference. Section 
14.05.030 of the UPMC, Adoption of codes by reference, is amended to read as follows: 

14.05.030 
Adoption of codes by reference. 

The following codes, insl~ded in the Slate 8Hildin9 Cede l:Jy RCW 19.27.931 and 19.27A.919 am! as 
amended and adef)teEI lly the Slate 8Hildin9 Cede CeHnsil flHFSHanl le RC'A' 19.27.974 and 19.27A.929 
are hereby adopted by this reference as if fully set forth in this chapter and as specifically modified or 
amended as set forth in this chapter. 

A. The Uniform Building Code (UBC) Volumes I.II & Ill and the UnifeFFR 8~ildin9 Cede StandaFds, -1-994 
1997 Edition, published by the International Conference of Building Officials, as adopted and amended by 
the Washington State Building Code Council and incl~EleEI in Chapter 51-40 WAC, and as may sub-

M:ord/building-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



sequently be amended by this chapter, are hereby adopted along with Appendix Chapters <l, 4 (Division I), 
9, 44, 15, 16, 33, and 34. 

B. The Uniform Mechanical Code (UMCl .:J.004 1997 Edition, iAGIHEliAg CFia13ter 1 ~. F'Hel Gas Pi13iAg, 
A1313eAElilc 8, published by the International Conference of Building Officials, as adopted and amended by 
the Washington State Building Code Council in Chapter 51-42 WAC. 

C. The Uniform Fire Code (UFC) Volumes I & II aml tl'le UAiklrFA F'ire Ceee SlaAElares, .:J-994... 1997 
Edition, published by the Uniform Fire Code Institute, as adopted and amended by the Washington State 
Building Code Council and included in Chapter ~ 51-44 and ~ 51-45 WAC and as may be 
subsequently amended by this chapter, are hereby adopted, along with the provisions of article 9 as 
subsequently amended by this chapter and; Appendix Chapters I-A, 1-B, 1-C, II-A, 11-C, 11-D, II- E, 11-F, 11-G, 
11-H, 11-1, 11-J, Ill-A, 111-B, 111-C, 111-D, IV-B, V-A, VI-A, Vl-B, Vl-C, Vl-D, Vl-E, and Vl-F; Vl-G, Vl-H, and VI-I; 
provided, that not withstanding any wording in this code, participants in religious ceremonies shall not be 
precluded from carrying hand-held candles. 

D. The Uniform Plumbing Code and the Uniform Plumbing Code Standards, .:J.004 1997 Edition, as 
published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, and as adopted by the 
Washington State Building Code Council and included in Chapters 81 20 aAEl 81 27 51-46 and 51-47 
WAC and as may be subsequently amended by this chapter, are hereby adopted with the exception of 
Chapters 11 and 12. 

E. The rules and regulations adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council for making 
building and facilities accessible to and usable by physically handicapped or elderly persons as provided 
in Chapter 51-30 WAC elfestive /\13ril 1, 1991. 

F. The Washington State Energy Code as adopted and amended by the Washington State Building 
Code Council and included in Chapter 51-11 WAC. effestive dHAe aG, 1998. 

G. The Washington State Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality Code as adopted and amended by the 
Washington State Building Code Council and included in Chapter 51-13 WAC., elfestive dHAe aG, 1998. 

H. Washington State Historic Building Code as adopted and amended by the Washington State 
Building Code Council and included in Chapter 51-19 WAC, first edition. 

I. Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, -W94 1997 Edition, as published by the 
International Conference of Building Officials, and as may be subsequently amended by this chapter. 

J. The Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition, as published by the International Conference of Building 
Officials, and as may be subsequently amended by this chapter. 

J,_!S. National Electrical Code as published by the National Fire Protection Association adopted by the 
State of Washington and enforced by the Tacoma Public Utilities, electrical division, with the current 
edition in force at the time of the adoption of the ordinance codified in this chapter along with other 
requirements of the electric utility. 

K., L. Uniform Sign Code, .:J.004 1997 Edition, published by the International Conference of Building Offi­
cials. 
(Ord. 45 § 1, 1995; Ord. 37 § 3, 1995). 

Section 3 Amending Section 14.05.110. Building code amendments. Section 14.05.110 
of the UPMC, Building code amendments, is amended to read as follows: 

M:ord/building-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



14.05.110 
Building code amenf)ments. 

The following sections in the adopted Uniform Building Code are hereby amended: 

A.Sewera§e Disflesal Aflflreval. SeslieA 1Ge.4.1.1 is miaea ta Uie UAiferm Btii!EliA§ Ceae aAEl reaas as 
follews: 

SestieA 1Ge.4 .1.1. Ne builEliA§ JlerFRit for the seAstruelieA er alteratieA ef aAy builEliA§ reqtiiriA§ 
sewera§e aisflesal faeilities ef aAy l1iAEl shall be isstiea uAtil a Sewer Availability Certilisate is 
issues by the City sewer fltlFVeyer. If a flUblie Sewer Availability Certilisate is RBI available the 
flFBflerl'; fflt!St be aflflF9VeEl fer seflliG taAk(s) by the Pierse CeuAty health EleflarlffleAt, iA writiA§, 
for the BGGtlflaAGY flFBflBSea. 

B.El(JliratieA ef Perfflit. The first seAteAGe ef the lirst JlaFa§Faflh ef SeslieA 1G@.4.4 ef the UAiform 
BuilEliA§ Ceae is hereby affleAElea ta reaa as follews: 

Every JleFfflit isstiea by the builEliA§ eflisial tiAEler the flFB'.'isieAs el this seae shall eJ(flire by 
lifflitatieA aAEl beseffle Aull aAEl veia if the bui!EliA§ er werl1 atitherizea by sueh Jlerfflit is Aet 
GBFRffleAeea withiA 3@G saleAElar Elays fFBffl the Elate el SUGA JleFfflit, BF if the latiilEliA§ BF WBFll 
autherizea is stisfleAElea er alaaAEleAeEl at aAy liffle after the werk is GBfflffleAsea for a fleriea el 
18G saleAElar Elays. 

C.EJ(fliratieA el PlaA Review. SeetieA 1G7.4 el the UAiforffl BtiilEliA§ Ceae is herelay affleAElea: 

SeetieA 1G7.4 (1) EicJliratieA el PlaA Review. /\flflliGatieAs fonvhish Re Jlerfflit is isstiea withiA 1BG 
saleAElar Elays fellewiA§ the Elate el aJlfllieatieA shall eJ(flire lay limitalieA, aAs fllaAs aAs ether sata 
stilamittes for review fflay lae thereafter rettirnes te the aJlflliGaAt er sestreyes lay the latiilsiR§ 
eflieial. The lauilsiA§ eflisial fflay eJ(teAs the liffle for aslieA lay the aflfllieaAt for a !Jeries Rel 
mrneediA§ 1 BG saleAsar says eA request lay the aflflliGaAt shewiA§ that sirsuFRslaAees laeyeAs the 
seAtrel el the aflfllisaAt have weveAtes aslieA freffl laeiA§ takeA. Ne aflflliGatieA shall lae exteAses 
FRere thaA eAGe. IA erser ta reAew aetieA BA aA aflfllisalieA after eJ(JliratieA, the aJlfllisaAt resulafflit 
fllaAs aAs flay a Rew fllaA review fee. 

The lauilsiA§ effeial shall eJ(!eml the life ef aA aflfllieatieA if aAy el the follewiA§ eeAsitieAs eidst: 

a. CeFRflliaAse with a seterffliAatieA el si§AilisaAse t1Aser the State EAvireAffleAtal Pelisy /\st 
flFBVisieAs is iA flFB§ress; er 

la. AAy ether City review is iA flFB§ress; flFBVises, City Staff seterffliAes that the review is 
flFBSeesiA§ te a tifflely liAal City ElesisieA; er 

s. Liti§alieA a§aiAst the City is iA flFe§ress, the eutseffle ef whish may attest the valisity el aAy 
Jlermit issties fltlFstiaAt te stish aflfllisatieA. 

(2) Perfflit EleeFRes reasy ta issue. Every Jlerfflit EleeFRes reasy te issue lay the laui!EliA§ eflisial 
t1Aser the flFBVisieAs el this sese shall lae elataiAes lay the aflflliGaAt withiA @G saleAsar says el the 
AetilisatieA ef the availalaility el sush Jlerfflit lay the lauilsiA§ eflisial er herlhis sesi§Aee er the 
flermit shall lae saAseles. UfleA saAsellatieA el aAy stish Jlerfflit, the Jlermit laeseFRes Aull aAs veis, 
aAs the latiilsiA§ eflisial shall Ratify the aJlflliGaAt lay sertilies fflail. 

D.AflflFeval Requires. SeslieA 1 GB.4 el the lJAiforffl Btii!EliA§ Cese is herelay affleAElee lay the assitieA el 
a Rew Jlara§Faflh te reas: 

All lauilsiA§S that have Rat reseives a liAal iASfleGtieA aAs aJlflFBVal shall Rel lae eGGUflies withetit 
writteA aJlflFBVal el the lauilsiA§ eflisial. 

M:ord/building-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



E.Certificate of Ossupancy. Para§rapA one of Sestion 199.1 on use anEI oscupansy of tAe llniferrn 
Bui!Eling CoEle is tieresy arnenEleEI.: 

No sui!Eling or structure sRall se useEI or occupieEI, ane no stiange in ttle el(isting oscupancy 
slassifisalion of a lluileing or structure or f)Ortien ttlereof sRall Ile rnaee IJA!il ttle llui!Eling otlisial 
tias issueEI a certifisate of essupancy tRerefere as JlroviaeEI tlerein. EXCEPTIOPI: 

· Group ll ocsupansies. 

A.Section 106.2, item #5 is amended to read: 

Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the bottom of the footing 
to the top of the wall, provided the wall is set back from any adjacent property lines or structures a 
distance at least equal to the height of the wall and the material retained slopes 1 :2 (or less) up and 
away from the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, II or II-A liquids. 

E1 .ReEtuirernent fer Report. Sestion :l97.1.€l of tRe llniferrn Bui!Eling CoEle, 1994 EElition, is tierelly 
arnenEleEI: 

B. Section 307.1.6 is amended by addition of the following exception: 

EXCEPTION: When an HMMP is required, the building official may accept the applicant report(s) 
used for compliance with requirements of 40 CFR "Hazardous Chemical Reporting and 
Community Right-to-Know Regulations" under Title Ill of the Superfund Amendments and 
Reauthorization Act of 1986 (SARA). 

F.Group R, Division 1 Ossupansies. Special Provisions. Sestion :l19.2.2 of !Re llniferrn Bui!Eling CeEle 
is tlerelly arnenEleEI: 

:l1G.2.2 Special Provisiens. PletwithstanEling other previsions of ttiis coEle, Greup R Division 1 
osswpancies sRall not Ile less ttlan one ho1Jr fire resistive censtrnction tRreugtleut. El(lerior 
13alconies ei(tenElin§ seyenEI !Re fleer area as ElefineEI sy Section 297 F stlall se constrwcteEI of 
noncorn8ustil31e rnaterials or as cornswstisle one tiowr fire resistive occupancy separation 
13etween wnits. 

Stera§e or launElry reerns !Rat are '.vithin Growfl R, Divisien 1 Occupansies ttlat are wseEI in 
cornrnon 13y tenants sRall lae separated frern ttle rest of the l3t1ilEling l3y not less !Ran ene tiour fire 
resistive osst113ansy separation. 

For Growp R, Divisien 1 Ossupancies with a Grot113 S, Divisien :l parking garage in !Re sasernent 
or fi;st story, see Sestion :l11.2.2. 

For allis spase partitiens and Elraft stops, see Sestien 798. 

Exterior and interier Eloors and windows opening into a serriaor, stairway, or sirnilar area serving 5 
er rnore dwellings llnits stlall se f)rotested as Sflesified in Sestion 19Q5.8. 

Fl.Sestien 49:l Sflesial 13revisiens fer Gret113 B anEI Grou13 R, 1 Ossuf)ansies. Ttle tille of Sestion 49:l 
of the llniferrn Bt1ilding Cede is heresy arnended: 

SECTIOPl 4Q:l SPECIAL PROVISIONS FOR /\bl BUILDING SEVEPI OR MORE STORIES IPI 
FIEIGFIT. 

l.Sestion 4Q:l.1 Ssef)e. Sestien 49:l.1 eftRe llniferrn Bui!Eling Cede is heresy arnended: 

M:ord/building-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



Hiis sestioR sl1all a13ply le all lluileliR§S seveR or more stories iR 11ei§l11. Susl1 lluilEliR§ sl1all Ile of 
Type I or II F.R. soRstrustio.R aREI sl1all Ile 13reviEleEI witl1 aR automatis s13riRl<ler system iR 
assorElaRse wit11 SestioR 40:0.2. 

J. Premises IEleRlifisatioR. SestioR §02 of !Re lJRiform BuilEliA§ CoEle is 11ereb}' ameAEleEl: 

Ap13roveEI Rumller or aEIElresses sl1all Ile rireviEleEI of a size Rel less tl1aR feur iRsl1es (4") iR 

11ei§l1t aREI sl1all Ile 13laseEI OR all Aew aREI eids!iA§ llui!EliA§S OREi OR SOAStrustioA sites is SUSA a 
13ositioR as to Ile fllaiRly visillle aREI le§illle from tl1e street or reaEI froRtiR§ tl1e 13re13erl';. Saia 
RUmllers sl1all soRlrast witl1 tl1eir llasl<§FeUREI. 

d1.Fire El(tiR§Uisl1iR§ Systems. SestioR 904.1.1 of tl1e lJRiform SuilEliR§ CoEle, 1994 EElitioR, is 11erelly 
ameAEleEI witl1 tAe followiAg aEIElitioAal 13aragrapl1 to FeaEl as follows: 

C. Section 904.2.1 is amended by the addition of the following paragraphs: 

The provisions of this section shall apply to existing all buildings te which are altered. repaired or 
remodeled to more than fifty percent of its county assessment value at the time of the first permit 
application, QI will Ile al!eree or repaireEl within any seventy month period of time therafter. Any 
additions to an existing structure shall be considered new construction and subject to the 
requirements of this section. 

Area separation walls as specified by UBC section 504.6 shall not be considered for reduction of 
floor areas noted in this chapter. 

K.Fire ExliR§Uisl1iA§ Systems RequireEI. SestioR 004 .2.2, item a, of !Re URiferm BuilEliR§ CeEle is 11erelly 
ameAEleEI: 

D. Section 904.2.2 item #5 is amended to read: 

5. All buildings four or more stories in height. For the purposes of this section. , a story sl1all Ile 
ElefiReEI as tl1at portioR of a lluilEliR§ lletweeR tl1e upper surfase of aRy floor aREI tl1e surgase of tl1e 
Amel floor or roof allove. 

K1 .DriRl<iR§ Estalllisl:tmeRIS. SestioR 904.2.:0.1 ef tl1e URiferm BuilEliR§ Ceele, 1994 EElitieR, is 11erelly 
ameREleEI to reaEI as follows: 

E. Section 904.2.3.1 is amended to read: 

904.2.3.1 Drinking Establishments. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in rooms used 
by the occupants for the consumption of alcoholic beverages, nightclubs, or dancing 
establishments where the total gross floor area exceeds 5,000 square feet. Area separation walls 
as noted in Section 504.6 of the Uniform Building Code shall not be considered to separate a 
building to enable deletion of the required fire sprinkler system. 

L.PlaRs Approval Fire EictiA§Uisl1iA§ Systems. SestieR 904 ef tl1e URiferm BuilEliA§ CeEle, 1994 
EElitioR, is 11ereby ameREleEl by tl1e aElElitieR ef SestieR 904.2.:0.8 OREi le reaEl as fellmvs: 

SestieR 904.2.:0.8 Approval ef Fire SpriRl<ler PlaRs. If requireEI by tl1e Fire Marsl1al, autematis 
spriAkler system plaRs s11all be ap13roveEI anEl stam13eEl by aR · iREle13eREleRI review O§eRsy, 
a1313roveEI by !Re builEliR§ effisial, 13rier le beiR§ sullmitleEl le !Re Fire Marsl1al fer a13proval. 

M:ord/building-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



M.l\Fea SeparatisA 'Nalls F'ire e>c!iA§HisFiiA§ Systems. SeslisA 994 sf !Fie UAiferm BHildiA§ Cade is 
Fiereby ameAded by !Fie additisA ~ SestieA 994.2.J.9 aAd te read as fellews: 

SestisA 994.2.J.9 Area SeparatieA 'Nalls. l\rea separatieA walls as spesified iA SestisA §94.e el 
!Fie UAiferm BHildiAg Cede sFiall Ast be Hsed le redHse !Fie ealsHlatieA ef fleer areas iA !Flis 
CF!apter. 

M1 .F'ire eJE!iA§HiSRiA§ Systems. SeetieA 994 ef !Re UAiferm BHildiAg Cede, 1994 editieA, is F!eresy 
ameAded by !Fie additieA ef SeetieA 994.2.Q aAd le Fead as fellews: 

F. Section 904 is amended by the addition ofa new section. section 904.2.10 

Section 994.2.9 904.2.10 Other Occupancy Requirements. In all occupancies requiring 2,000 gal­
lons per minute or more of fire flow per Appendix Ill-A of the Uniform Fire Code, or where the total 
floor area included within the surrounding exterior walls on all floor levels including basements 
exceeds 10,000 square feet. Area separation walls, as noted in Section 504.6 of the Uniform 
Building Code, shall not be considered to separate a building to enable deletion of the required fire 
sprinkler system. EXCEPTION: Group U occupancies. 

N.SlaAElpipes WF!ere ReqHiree. SeetieA 994.§.2 ef !Fie UAiferm BHileiAg Ceee is 19ereby ameAeee: 

SeetieA 904.§.2 V\111eFe ReqHiFee. StaAepipe systems sFiall Ile provieee as set fertFi iA Table Q /\. 
IA lieH ef Class II staAepipes, !Fie F'ire CF!ief may, iA writiAg, reqHire !Fie Hse ef Class I staAepipes. 
TF!e siw aAe AHmber ef eHtlets aAe iAlets aAe leeatieA ef pipiAg sFiall be appFevee by !Fie F'ire 
CF!ief er Fier/Fiis eesigAee. 

G. Section 1003.3.3 is amended to read as written in the Uniform Building Code, 1997 
Edition, as published by the International Conference of Building Officials. and not as 
amended by chapter 51-40 WAC. 

H. Appendix Chapter 33. Excavation and Grading is amended by replacement of all 
references to Building Official with Citv Engineer. 

(Ord. 45 § 3, 1995; Ord. 37 § 11, 1995). 

Section 4 Amending Section 14.05.120, Fire code amendments. Section 14.05.120 of 
the UPMC, Fire code amendments, is amended to read as follows: 

14.05.120. 
Fire code amendments. 

The following sections in the Uniform Fire Code are hereby amended: 

A.Permits aRe F'ees UF'C SeetieR 19§.J l\meReee. Section 105.3 ef !Fie UAiferm F'ire Ceee, 1994 
eaitiaR, is Fiereby amended to read: 

Section 105.3(a) Permit Applications. All applications for a permit required by this Code shall be 
made to the Fire District in such form and detail as it shall prescribe. Applications for permits shall 
be accompanied by such plans as required by the Chief. 

Section 105.3(b) Permit Fees. The Fire District shall collect fees for permits, plan review, and 
inspection services as prescribed in the City of University Place "F.ee Schedule." 

M:ord/building-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



B.DeliAiliens UFC Section 2Q1 AmeAded. AFlisle 2 ef the UAiferm Fire CeEle, 1994 EEli!ieA, is heresy 
amended by adding to the stated sections the following entitled "Definitions" to read as follows: 

Section 207. Fixed Fire Protection System. All automatic or manual sprinkler systems, standpipe 
systems, fire alarm systems, fire detection and/or warning systems, fire and/or explosion 
suppressions systems, fire alarm signaling systems or other equipment or devices that are 
intended to detect, control or extinguish a fire or explosion that are built-in or affixed to the 
premises they protect. 

C.Section 901.4.3 is amended to read: 

901.4.3 Fire-protection equipment and fire hydrants. Fire-protection equipment and fire hydrants shall 
be clearly identified in an approved manner to pervent obstruction by parking and other obstructions. [';_ 
minimum unobstructed distance of 15 feet on both sides of a fire hydrant along the access roadway 
shall be maintained. See section 901.7 for fire lane marking. 

D. A new section 901.7 is added reading: 

901.7 Fire Lane Marking. When. in the opinion of the chief, it is probable that the width of an access 
road may be diminished or access to Fire-Protection equipment or fire hydrants may be obstructed, the 
chief may require the marking of fire lanes to include signs posted at appropriate locations. 

Marking of access roads shall be painted with international red colored paint. 

Fire Lanes shall be identified by a 8 inch wide line and block letters 4 inches high painted in the lane. at 
30 feet, or such other intervals which the Chief determines to be reasonable, stating "Emergency Vehicles 
Only-No Parking''. Signs shall be posted on or immediately next to the curb line, or on the building. Signs 
shall be 12" x 18" and shall have letters and background of contrasting colors, readily legible from at least 
a 50 foot distance. Signs shall be posted at a minimum no further than 50 feet apart. unless a greater 
distance is deemed reasonable by the Chief, nor shall they be more than 4 feet from the ground unless a 
greater height is determined necessarv by the Chief. 

E. A new paragraph is added to section 902.2.4.1 reading: 

Construction and maintenance of Emergency Vehicle Access (EV) shall be in accordance with 
University Place Municipal Code section 13.15.560. 

C.Fire De13artmeAt Assess UFC SestieA 9Q2 AmemleEI. Artisle 2 ef the UAiferm Fire CeEle, 1994 
EElitieA, is heresy ameAEleEI le reae as fellews: 

SestieA 9Q2 Fire DepartmeAt /'.ssess. 

9Q2.1 GeAeral. Fim Ele13artmeAI assess reaEls eA 13rivate 13re13erty sl'lall se 13reviEleEI . aAEI 
maiAtaiAeEI iA asserElaAse witi'I SestieAs 9Q1 aAEI 9Q2. 

9Q2.2 Fire A1313aratus Assess ReaEls. 

9Q2.2. 1 ReEJuireEI Assess. Fire a1313aratt1s assess re a Els si'lall se 13reviEleEI iA asserElaRse witi'I 
SestieAs 9Q1 aAEI 9Q2.2 fer every fasility, st1i1EliA!l er 13ertieA ef a suilEliA!l "1ereafter seRslrt1steEI er 
me•ieEI iAte er witAiA t"1e jt1risElistieA wheA aAy 13ertieA ef t"1e fasility er aAy 13ertieA ef aA eJ(\erier 

M:ord/building-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



wall of Uie first stofy of the 81JilEling is losateEI mofe than 1 §Q feet fFom life apparat1Js assess as 
meas1JmEI sy an appmveEI ro.ute arnunEI the miterior of the suilEling or fasility. See also Seotion 
QQ2.a for 13efsonnel assess to 13ui1Elings. 

E:XCE:PTIONS: 

1. When 13ui1Elings am sompletely prntesteEI with an a13pfoveEl a1Jtomatis fife sprinlller system, the 
prnvisions of Seotion QQ2.2.1 anEl 9Q2.2.2 may ee moElilieEI sy the Chief. · 

2. When assess fOaEls eannot se installeEI Elue to foeation on JlFOpeFty, !opograpRy, waterways, 
nonnegotiasle graEles or otRer similaf eonElitions, the Chief is authorizeEI to feEjUife aEIElitional fife 
j3FOtestion as speeifieEI in Sestion1QQ1 .9. 

a. 1NRen them afe not mom than two Grn1Jp R, Division a or U Ossupansies, the mEJuiFoments of 
Sestions QQ2.2.1 anEI QG2.2.2 may se moElilieEI sy !Re Chief. MoFO than one fiFO a13paratus mad 
shall ee 13rnviEleEI when it is EletefmineEI ey tl'le Chief that assess ey a single rnael might se 
im13aiFeEI sy vehisle songestion, sonElition of terrain, slimatis sonElitions or othef faotoFS tl'lat soulel 
limit assess. 

!"or higR 13ileEI someustisle storage, see Sestion 81G2.a.1. 

!"or FeEjuifeEI assess eluring sonstruetion, alteration or Elemolition of a 13ui1Eling, see Sestion 87G4.2. 

QG2.2.2 S13esifisations. 

QQ2.2.2.1 !Jimensions. F'im a1313aratus assess roaEls shall have an unesstfusteel wielth of net less 
tRan 2G feet anel an unosstrusteel vertieal clearance of not less than 1 a feet e inohes. 

E:XCE:PTIO~l: Vertisal slearanee may se meluseel, 13rnviEleel sush feElustion Eloes net im13air 
assess sy fife a1313aratus anEI a1313ro•1eEI signs afe installeEI anEI maintaineEI inElisating !Re 
estaelisheel vertisal clearanoe when a13prnveEI sy !Re Chief. 

Vertisal elearances or wielths SRall se insfeaseEI when, in the 013inion of the Chief, vertisal 
clearanses or wiElths am not aseEJuate to 13rnvise fim a1313matus assess. 

QQ2.2.2.2 SuFfase. F'im a13paratus assess rnaels shall se Elesignes anEI maintaines to su1313ort the 
im13oses loaEls of lim a1313aratus anel shall 

se 13rnviEleEI with a suFfase so as to 13rovise all weather Elriving ea13al3ilities. 

QG2.2.2.a T1Jrning Rasius. The turning rasi1Js of a fim a1313arat1Js assess mael si'lall se as ap13FOveel sy 
the Ci'lief. 

9G2.2.2.4 Deas enEls. Deael enel life a13paratus assess rnaEls in exsess of 1§G feet in !en9th shall ee 
13roviEleEI ·.vith ap13rnves 13rovisions for the t1Jfning aro1Jns of fire a1313aratus. 

QG2.2.2.§ BriElges. When a srisge is feEJuiFOs to ee 1Jseel as 13art of a fim ap13aratus assess mas, it 
si'lall se eonstfustes anEI maintaines in aeeorsanee with nationally msognizeEI stanelarels. See Artiele 
QQ, Stanelarel a.1.1. Ti'le eriElge si'lall ee ElesigneEI for a live loaEI suffieient to earry tlie im13oseEI !oass 
of fire a1313aratus. 

M:ord/building·codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



VeF!isle leas lifflils sF!all 13e pestes al se!Fi enlranses te sris§es wFien reEtuires 13y !Fie CF!ief. 

9Q2.2.2.e Crase. TF!e !Jrasienr' fer a fire apparatus assess reas sF!all net eimees !Fie fflaJ<ifflllffl 
appre>•es sy !Fie CF!ief. 

9G2.2.a Marl1in!J. See Seslien 9Q1 .4. 

9Q2.2.4 Osslruslien ans Cenlrel ef Fire /\pparalus Assess. 

9Q2.2.4.1 General. Tile FeE11Jiree wie!Fi ef a fire apparat!Js assess read s"1all nel ee eeslrnsles in any 
ff!anner, insl!Jdin§ parkin§ ef veF!isles. TF!e fflinifflllffl reEtuires wistFis and slearanses esta131is"1es 
unser Sestien 9Q2.2.2.1 s"1all 13e fflainlained al all tirnes. 

Enlranses te reass, trails er et'1er assess ways wFiisli liave seen slesee with §ates and sarriers in 
assersanse wi!Fi Seslien 9Q2.2.4 .2 sF!all net se el3strustes 13y parkes veFiisles. 

E.Fire Eiain@uisF!in§ Systeffls UFC Sestien 1GGa.2.8 Arnenaes. Sestien 1GGa.2.8 ef !Fie Uniferffl Fire 
Cese, 1994 Esilien, is Fiereby aff!enses te reas as fellews: 

1GGa.2.8 Gre!!p R, Divisien 1 Oseupansies. An autefflatis sprinl<ler sysleffl s"1all se installed 
tF!reU§Ae!Jt all Gre!Jp R, Divisien 1 essupansies Flavin§ tFiree er ff!ere sleries in Fiei§Fit er sentainin§ 
five er ff!ere swellin!J !!nits, eveF'/ sen§re§ale resisense IF!ree er fflere sleries in Fiei§AI er Flavin§ an 
eseupanl leas ef 1Q er fflere, ane evePf Fietel tFiree er ff!ere sleries in Fiei§At er senlainin§ 1 Q er ff!ere . 
§Uest reerns. Resieenlial er '!!Jisk respense stanears sprinklers sF!all se uses in Ifie Elwellin§ units 
ans !JUest reeffl pertiens ef !Fie 81Ji1Elin§. Area se13aratien walls as netee in Sestien eG4.e ef tF!e 
Uniferffl !luilsin§ Cese sF!all se net sensiseres a separate buildin§ te enable !Fie seletien ef the 
reEtuires sprinkler systeffl. 

F.Slanelpipes ReEtuiree. Seslien 1QQ4.2 ef tAe Uniferrn Fire Ceele is liereby aff!endeel te reael as fellews: 

1QQ4.2 ReEtuired lnstallaliens. Stanepipe systeffls sFiall be 13revided as set fertFi in Tal31e 1GQ4 A. In 
lieu ef Class II standpipes, !Fie Fire Chief er Flis Elesi§nee fflay, in wrilin!J, reEtuire tF!e use ef Class I 
standpipes. The size, nuff!ber ef ei,itlets, anel lesatien ef pipiA§ and fittiA§S shall be apflre1•es S)' the 
Fire CF!ief er her/Flis sesi§nee. 

(Ord. 45 § 4, 1995; Ord. 37 § 12, 1995). 

Section 5. Severability If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this Title shall be 
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or 
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section, sentence, 
clause or phrase of this Title. 

Section 6. Publication and Effective Date. A summary of this ordinance consisting 
of its title shall be published in the official newspaper of the city. This ordinance shall be effective 
five days after such publication. 

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL ON JUNE 1, 1998 

D~/ct;,,_~d 
15ebbie Klosowski, Mayor 

M:ord/building-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT



ATTEST: 

cCP"2 ... . ::n .;22~,_,,_,, 
Susan Matthew, City Clerk 

an, City Attorney 

Date of Publication: 6/3/98 
6/8/98 Effective Date: 

,. 

M:ord/bullding-codes update.doc 

UNOFFICIAL DOCUMENT




